

Keller, Reynolds, Drake,  
Johnson and Gillespie, P.C.

P. O. BOX 598  
HELENA, MONTANA 59624  
TELEPHONE (406) 442-0230

NOTICE OF IDENTIFYING NO.  
FEDERAL - 81-0436130

OFFICE OF PUBLIC DEFENDER  
HELENA MT

Page: 1  
02/10/2014  
Account No: 99999-00000M  
Statement No: 38368

Fees

			Hours
01/01/2013	REG	Review LFD analysis of the OPD budget request.	1.00
	REG	Review LFD analysis of the OPD budget request.	1.00
01/02/2013	REG	REview e-mails and reply.	0.80
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.80
01/03/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.20
	REG	.Review SB85.	0.20
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.20
	REG	Review SB85.	0.20
01/06/2013	REG	Review MTCDLA e-mails regarding OPD lawyer and respond.	0.20
	REG	Review SB85.	0.10
	REG	Review MTCDLA e-mails regarding OPD lawyer and respond.	0.20
	REG	Review SB85.	0.10
01/07/2013	REG	Review legislative presentations.	0.60
	REG	E-mail OPD regarding presentation.	0.10
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.30
	REG	Review legislative presentations.	0.60
	REG	E-mail OPD regarding presentations.	0.10
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.30
01/08/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.80
	REG	Telephone conference with H. Freebourn regarding legislation	1.40
01/09/2013	REG	Attend legislative hearings.	1.80
	REG	Prepare for subsection D hearings with staff.	2.10
01/10/2013	REG	Attend court and clerk conference.	1.20
	REG	Conference with B. Hooks on several subjects.	1.30
	REG	Review and reply to e-mails.	2.10
01/11/2013	REG	Attend legislative hearings.	3.00
	REG	Draft and deliver letter to Senate Judiciary.	0.50
01/14/2013	REG	Telephone conference with Harry regarding fiscal note SB53.	0.50
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.50

			Hours
01/15/2013	REG	Telephone conference with H. Freebourn regarding legislation.	1.00
	REG	Telephone conference with K. Olson regarding appropriations.	0.80
01/16/2013	REG	Attend appropriation hearing.	4.50
	REG	Legal research regarding opposition to SB133.	0.30
	REG	Telephone conference with B. Hooks and H. Freebourn regarding appropriation information and SB133.	0.30
01/17/2013	REG	Attend appropriation hearing.	2.50
	REG	Conference with B. Hooks HB107 and other agency matters.	0.60
	REG	Prepare for hearing on SB133.	0.90
	REG	Work on SB53.	1.80
01/18/2013	REG	Attend hearing on SB133 and executive action on HB103	3.20
01/21/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.30
	REG	Telephone conference with H. Freebourn regarding legislature.	0.60
	REG	Draft SB53 handout for HJ with legal research.	3.30
01/22/2013	REG	Attend legislature regarding support for bills being transmitted and report.	0.80
	REG	Work on assessments and collections.	0.30
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.40
	REG	E-mails regarding SB133 and better ID for the investigators.	0.90
	REG	Conference with ACLU.	1.00
01/23/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.40
01/24/2013	REG	Attend legislature.	1.00
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.50
01/25/2013	REG	Attend legislature.	0.80
	REG	Study the effect of SB53 on ability to arrest.	2.60
01/27/2013	REG	Prepare for legislative hearings.	1.70
01/28/2013	REG	Attend legislative hearing.	2.70
	REG	Legal research regarding arrest on failure to appear on notice to appear.	0.90
	REG	Respond to inquiry regarding caseloads.	0.70
	REG	Telephone conference with H. Freebourn and C. Green regarding accounting bill.	0.40
01/29/2013	REG	Attend hearing on SB53.	3.00
	REG	Staff meeting regarding DN cases.	0.70
	REG	E-mail City Attorney office regarding SB53 amendments.	0.20
	REG	Review and reply to e-mails regarding collections.	0.20
01/30/2013	REG	Legislature regarding SB53.	1.80
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.70
01/31/2013	REG	Attend legislature.	2.50
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.40
02/01/2013	REG	Attend legislative hearings and conferences with Governor's staff.	4.30
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.10
02/04/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.10

			Hours
02/05/2013	REG	Attend legislature and plan for Wednesday hearing.	2.40
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.40
	REG	Prepare for budget hearing.	1.30
	REG	Meeting with Rep. Hill.	2.40
02/06/2013	REG	Attend legislature.	3.00
	REG	Attend meeting with Rep. Dudik.	0.30
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.10
02/07/2013	REG	E-mail Rep. Gibson regarding contractor rates.	0.40
	REG	Review e-mails and reply regarding LC1717.	0.90
	REG	REview materials regarding misdemeanors.	1.00
	REG	REview e-mails and reply.	0.70
	REG	Telephone conference regarding PDC meeting and death penalty hearing.	0.20
02/08/2013	REG	Telephone conference with S. Crichton regarding legislative issues.	0.20
	REG	Look for DN legislation and add agenda item.	3.00
02/11/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.50
02/12/2013	REG	Appear at Legislature on HB 93.	1.40
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.40
02/13/2013	REG	Attend Legislature.	1.90
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.40
	REG	Prepare cover letter to resolution.	1.80
02/14/2013	REG	Review e-mails, reply and send.	0.50
	REG	Revise cover letter.	1.00
	REG	Conference call regarding accounts receivable..	0.80
	REG	Prepare for PDC meeting.	1.80
02/15/2013	REG	Attend PDC meeting.	7.80
02/16/2013	REG	Finish cover letter.	3.90
02/17/2013	REG	Revise of the resolution cover letter.	1.40
02/18/2013	REG	Attend Legislature.	0.80
	REG	Review SB 272, HB 432 and HB 504.	3.60
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.20
02/19/2013	REG	Attend Legislature.	3.50
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.50
02/20/2013	REG	Attend Legislature.	1.00
	REG	Conference with Judge Sherlock.	0.50
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.80
	REG	Telephone conference with Bill Hooks.	0.70
02/21/2013	REG	Attend Legislature.	4.00
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.40
02/22/2013	REG	Attend Legislature.	4.50
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.60

		Hours
	REG Telephone conference with S. Crichton.	0.30
02/25/2013	REG Review e-mails and reply.	0.70
	REG Telephone conference with S. Crichton.	0.50
	REG Telephone conference with H. Freebourn.	1.20
02/26/2013	REG Review e-mails and reply.	0.30
02/27/2013	REG Review e-mails and reply.	0.20
02/28/2013	REG Review e-mails.	0.20
03/01/2013	REG Review e-mails and reply.	0.40
03/05/2013	REG Review materials for forwarding to legislators regarding caseloads.	3.80
03/06/2013	REG Review e-mails and reply.	0.20
	REG Work on appropriations.	0.70
03/07/2013	REG Attend session.	4.50
	REG Conference regarding budget hearings.	1.30
	REG Draft letter to governor regarding capital defense fund.	0.80
03/08/2013	REG Work on appropriations.	2.10
	REG Telephone conference with Harry regarding appropriations.	0.20
	REG Review e-mails and reply.	0.20
03/11/2013	REG Attend session.	1.00
	REG Conference with Attorney Van Horssen.	0.30
	REG Review e-mails and reply.	0.10
03/12/2013	REG Attend legislature.	0.60
	REG Review information on SB 133.	0.50
03/18/2013	REG Visit to Capitol.	0.60
	REG Review e-mails and reply.	0.60
	REG Attend conference regarding Rep. Gideon.	1.00
	REG Conference with S. Crichton.	1.40
03/19/2013	REG Review e-mails and reply.	0.70
03/20/2013	REG Review e-mails and reply.	0.90
03/21/2013	REG Visit Legislature and conferences with S. Crichton.	3.00
	REG Work on amendments and other legislative papers.	2.40
03/22/2013	REG Visit legislature.	1.30
	REG Prepare for and interview by M. Anderson.	1.40
03/24/2013	REG E-mail Sen. Rosendale regarding SB 133 and distribute.	1.40
	REG Work on talking points.	0.30
03/25/2013	REG Conference with Sen. Rosendale and lobbyists regarding SB 133.	0.60
	REG Review e-mails and reply.	1.30
	REG Revise talking points.	2.60

			Hours
03/26/2013	REG	Work on talking points.	1.30
	REG	Attend Legislature and meeting regarding legislative action.	2.90
	REG	E-mail S. Crichton regarding letter.	0.10
	REG	Draft white paper on management.	0.70
03/27/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.90
	REG	Work on white papers.	3.90
	REG	Telephone conference with Missoula newspaper.	1.00
	REG	Telephone calls regarding legislative action.	0.60
03/28/2013	REG	Visit to Legislature.	0.60
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.90
	REG	Finish papers.	2.10
	REG	Conference regarding legislation.	2.00
03/31/2013	REG	Review K. Gray e-mail and reply.	1.50
04/01/2013	REG	Conference with J. Molloy regarding budget.	0.80
	REG	Prepare testimony before SFC.	3.20
	REG	Telephone conference with jessica.	0.40
04/02/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.20
04/03/2013	REG	Review audit reports.	0.30
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.60
	REG	Prepare for hearing.	1.90
	REG	Attend session, interview and meetings on presentation to SFC.	4.10
04/04/2013	REG	Attend hearing on study bill and work on SFC hearing.	3.00
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.20
04/05/2013	REG	Attend SFC.	1.00
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.60
04/08/2013	REG	SFC hearings.	8.00
	REG	Conferences with staff regarding testimony.	1.30
04/09/2013	REG	Capitol visit regarding SFC addition.	1.00
	REG	Conference with S. Crichton.	1.10
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.60
	REG	Telephone conferences with H. Freebourn.	0.70
04/10/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.80
04/11/2013	REG	REview e-mails and reply.	0.60
	REG	Telephone conference with Sen. Wanzenried.	0.20
	REG	Telephone conference with staff.	1.60
	REG	Attend session.	2.00
04/12/2013	REG	Capitol visit.	2.40
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.20
04/15/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.60
	REG	Draft letter to E. with legal research.	1.20
	REG	Attend session.	2.60

			Hours
04/16/2013	REG	Revise E. letter with legal research.	2.10
	REG	Attend session.	2.00
04/17/2013	REG	Attend session on HJ20.	2.20
	REG	Telephone conference with H. Freebourn.	0.50
04/18/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.00
	REG	Analyze staffing needs.	0.90
04/19/2013	REG	Evaluate staffing needs.	0.30
	REG	Telephone conference with H. Freebourn regarding budget.	0.50
04/22/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.50
	REG	Review HB2.	0.80
04/24/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.40
04/25/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.40
04/26/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.50
	REG	Telephone conference with S. Crichton.	0.30
04/29/2013	REG	Work on appointments.	0.90
04/30/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.80
05/01/2013	REG	Review emails and reply	0.20
05/03/2013	REG	Review emails and reply including a review of Simone Wilson's write up on Montana	1.60
05/06/2013	REG	Review emails and voice messages and reply	0.80
05/09/2013	REG	Review emails and reply	0.20
05/16/2013	REG	Conference with Bill Hooks	1.00
	REG	Review emails and reply	0.60
05/20/2013	REG	Review emails and reply	0.30
05/21/2013	REG	Review emails and reply	0.20
05/22/2013	REG	Review Yarlott order	1.80
05/23/2013	REG	Review emails and reply	1.30
06/03/2013	REG	Telephone conference with Kristina.	0.30
	REG	Telephone conference with S. Crichton.	1.30
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.60
06/04/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.30
	REG	Telephone conference with W. Zolynski regarding ability to pay and personnel matters.	0.10
06/05/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.30

			Hours
06/06/2013	REG	Review draft FY 14 operating plan outline.	2.20
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.30
06/10/2013	REG	Telephone conference with B. Hooks regarding litigation.	0.30
	REG	Telephone conference with C. Petaja regarding committee meetings.	0.30
06/13/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.40
06/14/2013	REG	Telephone conference with K. Neal regarding six month rule.	0.20
06/19/2013	REG	Review e-mails and mail and reply or forward.	1.50
06/21/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.70
06/25/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.40
06/26/2013	REG	Conference with Brent.	0.30
	REG	Review and reply to e-mails.	0.30
	REG	Telephone conference with Carleen Green.	0.10
	REG	Prepare for meeting with DOA and DOR.	0.50
06/27/2013	REG	Conference regarding accounts receivable rules.	1.00
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.40
07/02/2013	REG	Review emails and reply	0.60
07/03/2013	REG	Review emails and reply	0.20
07/08/2013	REG	Conference ACLU re study	2.40
	REG	Conference with B. Hooks	1.00
07/10/2013	REG	Attend LJIC meeting	2.50
07/11/2013	REG	Attend contract committee meeting	2.00
	REG	Prepare for PDC meeting	1.20
07/12/2013	REG	Telephone conference with Wade	0.50
	REG	Review emails and reply	0.10
07/15/2013	REG	Attend PDC meeting	7.80
	REG	Conference with B. Hooks	1.40
07/17/2013	REG	Review motion and brief on refusing cases and provide comment	1.20
07/22/2013	REG	Commissioner nominee qualifications	0.50
07/23/2013	REG	Email re commissioner nominee for Snell and about Ferriter	0.30
	REG	Review conflicts report	0.20
07/31/2013	REG	Review emails and reply	0.20
08/02/2013	REG	Telephone call for Kristina.	0.20
08/05/2013	REG	Review e-mails regarding assessments and collections and reply.	0.20
	REG	Telephone conference with Kristina Neal.	0.20

			Hours
08/06/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.70
08/20/2013	REG	Review E-mail regarding ARs and collections and reply.	0.50
	REG	Telephone conference with Wade regarding personnel issue and ACLU.	0.40
08/21/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.00
08/26/2013	REG	Review e-mail regarding LJIC agenda and e-mail OPD.	0.10
	REG	Review B. McLaughlin letter and e-mail OPD staff.	0.30
	REG	Review other e-mails and reply.	0.60
09/12/2013	REG	Conference with Harry Freebourne regarding several matters.	1.30
09/13/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.30
	REG	Telephone conference with W. Zolynski.	0.40
09/16/2013	REG	Telephone conference with Harry.	0.10
	REG	Review C. R. complaint and Missoulain.	1.00
09/17/2013	REG	Review C. R. response	0.40
	REG	Meeting on LJIC.	3.50
09/18/2013	REG	Review C. R. e-mail.	0.10
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.50
09/19/2013	REG	Attend LJIC meeting.	1.10
09/23/2013	REG	Review C. R. e-mail.	4.10
09/24/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply; reply to C. R.	5.70
09/25/2013	REG	Work on C. R. reply.	5.60
	REG	Review evaluations.	0.50
09/26/2013	REG	Staff evaluations.	6.50
	REG	Study C. R. documents.	0.60
09/27/2013	REG	Finish C. R. review.	4.70
09/30/2013	REG	Finish the C. R. letter.	2.60
	REG	E-mail the PDC regarding action I took on C. R. complaint.	0.30
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.80
	REG	Review City's brief regarding refusing cases and conference with B. Hooks regarding strategy.	1.00
10/01/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.60
	REG	Review state brief on caseload limitation and forward to the PDC.	0.40
	REG	Work on revising assessment/collections section of annual report.	0.70
10/02/2013	REG	Work on assessments/collections report.	0.30
10/08/2013	REG	Review C. R. e-mail, research and reply.	1.80
10/09/2013	REG	Review C. R. e-mail and reply.	2.70
10/10/2013	REG	Attend meeting on raises for program leaders.	1.40

			Hours
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.30
10/11/2013	REG	Ridge e-mail and add to draft.	2.00
	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.50
	REG	Attend contract meeting.	0.80
	REG	Review order regarding motion to limit cases.	0.20
10/14/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.50
10/16/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.20
	REG	Prepare for meeting.	0.60
10/18/2013	REG	Attend PDC.	6.50
10/21/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	1.90
10/22/2013	REG	Telephone conference with Harry Freebourn.	0.40
10/29/2013	REG	Telephone conference with Wade regarding field reports and contract for CR appeal.	0.40
10/30/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.20
	REG	Review writ application and memo on substitution and e-mail CPD.	0.80
11/05/2013	REG	E-mail H. Freebourn regarding November 6, 2013 meeting and telephone call.	0.30
11/06/2013	REG	Prepare for and meeting at Capitol.	3.00
11/07/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.40
11/12/2013	REG	Telephone conference with W. Zolynski.	0.40
11/13/2013	REG	Review e-mail regarding CR and reply.	0.20
11/14/2013	REG	Review article regarding Missoula judges and telephone conference with B. Hooks.	0.50
11/18/2013	REG	Review Hooks e-mail regarding Billings Gazette and telephone call for bill.	0.20
11/21/2013	REG	Review e-mail regarding audit committee and reply.	0.20
11/22/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.40
11/25/2013	REG	Review e-mails regarding meetings.	0.20
11/26/2013	REG	Attend meeting.	1.00
12/02/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.30
12/09/2013	REG	Review e-mails and reply.	0.30
12/11/2013	REG	Review P. P. letter to PDC.	0.80
12/12/2013	REG	Review P. P. materials.	1.60
		For Current Services Rendered	<u>377.00</u>